
Third  Issue  of  2007’s  Revue
Critique  de  Droit  International
Privé
The latest issue of the French Revue Critique de Droit International Privé has
been released.  In  addition to  9  comments  of  French and European cases,  it
contains two articles. The table of contents can be found here.

The  first  article  is  authored  by  Dr.  A.  Aldeeb  Abu-Sahlieh,  who  teaches  in
Lausanne, Marseille and Palermo. It deals with Muslim Family and Inheritance
Law in Swizterland (Droit musulman de la famille et des successions en Suisse).
The English abstract reads:

The fundamental opposition between Coranic family law and the Swiss legal
order concerns, on the one hand, the very conception of law, here the work of
God, there the work of man, and on the other hand, the divisions of society,
which  on  the  one  hand  follow  religious  obedience,  and  on  the  other,
territoriality or nationality. The resulting antagonisms are of daily and practical
import, since they affect marriage, parent-child relationship or succession. They
will find a solution only if, within the Arab world, sources of religious law are
confined to the Coran, and indeed if social governance leaves room for reason,
and, in the western world, if the concept of revelation reinvests its reason-
liberating  dynamic,  and if  there  is  a  firm reaction  to  all  violations  of  the
principle of secularity and non-discrimination on the basis of race or religion.

The second article is authored by Professor Hélène Chanteloup, who lectures at
Amiens University.  It  addresses the issue of National Laws Being Taken into
Account by EC Courts (La prise en consideration du droit national par le juge
communautaire. Contribution à la comparaison des méthodes et solutions du droit
communautaire et du droit international privé). The English abstract reads:

Far from the difficulties raised by the question of the right and duty of national
courts when foreign law is applicable, the question of the status of the national
laws pleaded in European litigations seems to be sobed with coherence and a
relative simplicity. Except the specific case of the arbitration clause (art. 238
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CE), the national law cannot be applied by European judges. It is just taken into
account like any other factual element of the situation. National law is treated
as a question of fact. Therefore, it is not to be imputed to European judges and
has to be proved by the party with evidence of all kinds. Furthermore, the
European Court of Justice has always considered that this question of proof has
to be solved in respect of the interests of the European law which contributes to
the coherence and the stability of the procedural treatment of national law.

Articles of the Revue Critique cannot be downloaded.


